HARFORD COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
PURCHASING BID REPORT

Bid #:

22-SHM-005

Bid Title:

Door Locks and Hardware

Date of Bid Opening:

January 4, 2022

Date of Bid
Advertisement:

November 30, 2021

Advertising Method:

EMaryland Marketplace and HCPS Website

DESCRIPTION OF BID:

Door Locks and Hardware for Various HCPS Locations

BID TABULATION

CONTRACT AWARDED TO:

Independent
Hardware, Inc

PROJECT NAME $ AMOUNT or (Non-Responsive/No Bid) EAS DBA Southern
Lock
Accredited Independ Craftma Sch
. IDN Lock and EAS DBA ool .
Grandid ent ster Advanced Advanced Security
alLLC AL | el Hardwar SOz Hardwar | Securit: R
g's Inc. Hardware ) Lock LLC Yy ciali ESTIMATED VALUE OF
Co. e, Inc e ty CONTRACT:
GROUP A: ROUND 1 Group A:
. Non - Independ
Dublin Elemental
. Responsi No ent $18,503.69
School -A
ve 3,998.93 2,712.35 2,331.01 2,359.32 2,666.25 3,857.00 | Bid Hardware,
Dublin EI Non - e
ublin Elementa
School -B . Responsi No EAS DBA
ve No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,438.00 | Bid Southern $15,855.81
Non - Lock
Edgewood Elementary )
School Responsi No
ve 6,057.50 4,252.60 3,578.11 3,562.20 4,044.75 6,606.00 | Bid
Non - Advanced $6,124.00
Fallston High School Responsi No Security
ve 1,018.56 916.60 896.36 901.12 872.00 624.00 | Bid
Non -
Fallston Middle School Responsi No Group B:
ve 423.38 423.70 365.12 318.58 379.25 499.00 | Bid Independe
N nt $3,170.51
Forest Hill Elementary on- Hardware,
School Responsi No Inc
ve 1,693.52 1,694.80 1,460.48 1,274.32 1,517.00 1,996.00 | Bid
EAS DBA
Forest Lakes Elementary Non - . Southern $22,775.71
Responsi No
School Lock
ve 1,142.42 981.40 865.92 847.25 951.75 1,831.00 | Bid
Fountain Green son T N
Elementary School esponsi °
. ve 535.33 485.20 412.87 447.14 478.25 1,253.00 | Bid Asdevcau':ic;d $156.00
Havre de Grace Non -
Elementary School - Responsi No
Group A ve 9,887.69 7,353.10 6,259.76 6,321.04 7,491.25 12,721.00 | Bid Total
otal:
Havre de Grace gon T \ Independ
Elementary School - B esponsi o .
i ve No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,062.00 | Bid Harznwtare, 321,674.20
Magnolia Elementary Non- Inc
School oo 14,438.85 11,311.00 9,500.05 9,614.25 | 11,300.00 17,450.00 g(; EAS DBA
ve 1239, A ERL ,0°% 20 200 ! Southern | $38,631.52
L Non - Lock
Magnolia Middle School | Responsi No
ve 12,487.92 10,228.00 8,354.92 8,260.56 | 10,101.00 15,620.00 | Bid
Southampton Middle Non- Advanced | $6,280.00
School Responsi No Security
ve 2,116.90 2,118.50 1,825.60 1,592.90 1,896.25 2,495.00 | Bid

GROUP B: ROUND 2




Non -

Aberdeen High School Responsi No
ve 1,693.52 1,830.40 1,460.48 1,274.32 1,517.00 1,996.00 | Bid
Non -

Aberdeen Middle School Responsi No
ve 1,270.14 1,372.80 1,095.36 955.74 1,137.75 1,497.00 | Bid

Abingdon Elementary Non - )

School Responsi No
ve 2,078.42 2,156.72 1,723.00 1,587.28 1,950.00 2,828.00 | Bid

Churchville Elementary | No"~

School Responsi No
ve 1,270.14 1,372.80 1,095.36 990.47 1,137.75 1,497.00 | Bid

Darlington Elementary Non-

School Responsi N'o
ve 254.64 247.48 224.09 225.28 218.00 156.00 | Bid

Edgewood Middle Non-

School Responsi N-0
ve 8,220.82 8,049.36 6,307.40 5,790.93 7,824.75 10,925.00 | Bid

Hickory Elementary Non-

School Responsi N-0
ve 1,932.66 2,019.56 1,804.29 1,681.83 1,764.25 1,825.00 | Bid
Non -

John Archer School Responsi No
ve 4,312.74 4,044.06 3,170.51 3,201.48 4,063.25 6,271.00 | Bid

North Harford Non-

Elementary School Responsi No
ve 2,116.90 2,288.00 1,825.60 1,592.90 1,896.25 2,495.00 | Bid

North Harford High Non-

School Responsi Np
ve 932.66 952.56 813.30 769.14 815.25 811.00 | Bid

Patterson Mill Middle Non-

School Responsi Np
ve 1,079.00 348.95 324.28 284.80 382.25 681.00 | Bid
Non -

Swan Creek School Responsi No
ve 10,109.80 10,026.20 8,036.00 7,848.30 9,946.25 15,495.00 | Bid

Independent Southern Advanced
MANUFACTUER Hardware Lock Security
locks-
Best 61/parts- 53
Command 56
Corbin Russwin 55
Don-Jo 60
Doromatic 57
Falcon 60
ILCO 51
Keedex 50
KiL 25
LCN 68
LSDA 25
Pemko 42
RCI 55
Schlage 58
SDC 45
Select 53
SFIC 65
Von Duprin 65
Yale 55

*not used as a determining factor in award

GROUP C: PERCENTAGE OFF MANUFACTURERS LIST PRICE (NOT INCLUDED IN BID TABLUATION)

Contract Terms: February 9, 2022 — February 8, 2023 with option for two (2) additional one (1) year periods

Contract Start Date: February 9, 2022

METHOD OF AWARD: [ Individual Items

x Group/Project

[ Total Bid

APPROVALS:

BUYER:

Sara %/W

1/25/22

Signature

24

Date




