HARFORD COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS
CONTRACT AWARD REPORT

Bid #:

23-SRM-027

Bid Title:

Athletic Trainer Services

Date of Bid Opening: May 10, 2023

Date of Bid

Advertisement:

March 31, 2023

Advertising Method: EMaryland Marketplace and HCPS Website

DESCRIPTION OF

Athletic Trainer Services

BID:
BID TABULATION .
School Location Biitech Sports ATI Physical MedStar Sports Maxim CONTRACT AWARDED TO:
T ici H .
herapy Medicine ;;’;’;jj;;’e ATI Physical Therapy
Aberdeen $  126,720.00 $  50,000.00 No Bid $  90,450.00
Bel Air $  126,720.00 $  50,000.00 $  45,000.00 $  90,450.00
C. Milton Wright $  126,720.00 $ 50,000.00 No Bid $ 90,450.00
Edgewood $  126,720.00 $ 50,000.00 No Bid $ 90,450.00
ESTIMATED VALUE OF
Fallston $  126,720.00 $ 50,000.00 $  45,000.00 $ 90,450.00
CONTRACT:
Harford Technical $  126,720.00 $ 50,000.00 No Bid $ 90,450.00 $500’00000
Havre de Grace $  126,720.00 $ 50,000.00 No Bid $ 90,450.00
Joppatowne $  126,720.00 $ 50,000.00 No Bid - $ 90,450.00
North Harford $  126,720.00 $  50,000.00 No Bid $  90,450.00
Patterson Mill $  126,720.00 $  50,000.00 $  45,000.00 $  90,450.00
Total $1,267,200.00 $ 500,000.00 $ 135,000.00 $ 904,500.00

Contract Terms: August 1, 2023 through July 31, 2024 with up to four (4) additional, one (1) year renewals

Contract Start Date: August 1, 2023

METHOD OF AWARD: [ |Individualltems [ ] Group  [X] Total Bid

APPROVALS:

BUYER:

S W 6/28/23

-~ Signature Date

Revision 9/9/22



