## HARFORD COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS CONTRACT AWARD REPORT

Bid #: 23-DSS-006  Bid Title: Remote Alarm Monitoring and On-Call Services  Date of Bid Opening: October 19, 2022  Date of Bid Advertisement: September 19, 2022  Advertising Method: EMaryland Marketplace Advantage and HCPS Website  DESCRIPTION OF BID: This contract provides 24-hour remote alarm monitoring, reporting, and notifications for the intrusion and fire alarm systems and on-call repair services for the intrusion alarm equipment  BID TABULATION Basis of Award or (Non-Responsive/No Bid) Section I Section II  Starlight Security, Inc.  Starlight Security, \$42,900.00 \$66,750.00  ESTIMATED ANNUAL VALUE OF CONTRACT: \$75,000.00  Contract Terms: 1 year with 5 additional, 1 year renewal options Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: June 11/09/2022 Date						
Date of Bid Opening:  October 19, 2022  Date of Bid Advertisement:  Advertising Method:  EMaryland Marketplace Advantage and HCPS Website  DESCRIPTION OF BID:  This contract provides 24-hour remote alarm monitoring, reporting, and notifications for the intrusion and fire alarm systems and on-call repair services for the intrusion alarm equipment  BID TABULATION  Basis of Award or (Non-Responsive/No Bid)  Section I Section II  Starlight Security, Inc.  Starlight Security, Inc.  Starlight Security, Inc.  CONTRACT AWARDED TO:  Starlight Security, Inc.  Starlight Security, Inc.  ST5,000.00  CONTRACT:  \$75,000.00  CONTRACT:  \$75,000.00  CONTRACT:  \$75,000.00	Bid #:	23-DSS-006				
Date of Bid Advertisement:  Advertising Method:  EMaryland Marketplace Advantage and HCPS Website  DESCRIPTION OF BID:  This contract provides 24-hour remote alarm monitoring, reporting, and notifications for the intrusion and fire alarm systems and on-call repair services for the intrusion alarm equipment  BID TABULATION  Basis of Award or (Non-Responsive/No Bid)  Section I Section II  Startlight Security, Inc.  Startlight Security, s42,900.00 \$66,750.00  ESTIMATED ANNUAL VALUE OF CONTRACT:  \$75,000.00  Contract Terms: 1 year with 5 additional, 1 year renewal options  Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD:   Individual Items   Group   Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER:   January 1, 1, 2022	Bid Title:	Remote Alarm Monitoring and On-Call Services				
Advertisement:  Advertising Method:  EMaryland Marketplace Advantage and HCPS Website    DESCRIPTION OF BID:	Date of Bid Opening:	October 19, 2022				
DESCRIPTION OF BID:  This contract provides 24-hour remote alarm monitoring, reporting, and notifications for the intrusion and fire alarm systems and on-call repair services for the intrusion alarm equipment  BID TABULATION  Basis of Award or (Non-Responsive/No Bid)  Section I Section II  Starlight Security, \$42,900.00 \$66,750.00  ESTIMATED ANNUAL VALUE OF CONTRACT:  \$75,000.00  Contract Terms: 1 year with 5 additional, 1 year renewal options  Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: AMAGE TO:  This contract provides 24-hour remote alarm monitoring, reporting, and notifications for the intrusion alarm equipment  CONTRACT AWARDED TO:  Starlight Security, Inc.   CONTRACT AWARDED TO:  Starlight Security, Inc.  Starlight Security, Inc.		September 19, 2022				
BID: Intrusion and fire alarm systems and on-call repair services for the intrusion alarm equipment  BID TABULATION Basis of Award or (Non-Responsive/No Bid) Section I Section II  Starlight Security, Inc.  ESTIMATED ANNUAL VALUE OF CONTRACT: \$775,000.00  Contract Terms: 1 year with 5 additional, 1 year renewal options Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL: BUYER: AMAGO AMARD: 11/09/2022	Advertising Method:	EMaryland Marketplace Advantage and HCPS Website				
BIDDERS  Basis of Award or (Non-Responsive/No Bid)  Section I Section II  Starlight Security, Inc.  Starlight Security, Inc.  Starlight Security, Inc.  ESTIMATED ANNUAL VALUE OF CONTRACT: \$75,000.00  Contract Terms: 1 year with 5 additional, 1 year renewal options  Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: 11/09/2022						
BIDDERS  Basis of Award or (Non-Responsive/No Bid)  Section I Section II  Starlight Security, Inc.  Starlight Security, \$42,900.00 \$66,750.00  ESTIMATED ANNUAL VALUE OF CONTRACT: \$75,000.00  Contract Terms: 1 year with 5 additional, 1 year renewal options  Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: AMAGE MARCE  11/09/2022		BID TABULATION			CONTRACT AWARDED TO	
Starlight Security, Inc.  \$42,900.00 \$66,750.00  ESTIMATED ANNUAL VALUE OF CONTRACT:  \$75,000.00  Contract Terms: 1 year with 5 additional, 1 year renewal options  Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: 11/09/2022						
Contract Terms: 1 year with 5 additional, 1 year renewal options  Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD:   Individual Items   Group   Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER:   11/09/2022		Section I	Section II			
Contract Terms: 1 year with 5 additional, 1 year renewal options  Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: 11/09/2022	_	\$42,900.00	\$66,750.00		ESTIMATED ANNUAL VALUE OF	
Contract Terms: 1 year with 5 additional, 1 year renewal options  Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER:				_		
Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: 11/09/2022					\$75,000.00	
Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: 11/09/2022						
Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: 11/09/2022						
Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: 11/09/2022						
Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: 11/09/2022						
Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: 11/09/2022						
Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: 11/09/2022						
Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023  METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: 11/09/2022	Out of Town Assessment Foods (Const. Assessment of Const.					
METHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items Group Total Bid  APPROVAL:  BUYER: 11/09/2022						
APPROVAL:  BUYER:	Contract Start Date: January 1, 2023					
BUYER: 11/09/2022	METHOD OF AWARD: ☐ Individual Items ☐ Group ☐ Total Bid					
	APPROVAL:					