## HARFORD COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS CONTRACT AWARD REPORT

Bid #:	25-JHP-023
Bid Title:	Stormwater and Drainage Improvements at Joppatowne High School
Date of Bid Opening:	June 24, 2025
Date of Bid Advertisement:	May 22, 2025
Advertising Method:	EMaryland Marketplace and HCPS Website

**DECRIPTION OF BID:** 

Stormwater and Drainage Improvements at Joppatowne High School

BIDDERS\$ AMOUNT or (Non-Responsive/No Bid)Lems Contracting Co., Inc.DXI Construction, Inc.\$877,000.00Fawn View Construction, Inc.\$881,910.00Lems Contracting Co., Inc.\$507,177.00Monumental Paving & Excavating, Inc.\$750,000.00	BIDDERS\$ AMOUNT or (Non-Responsive/No Bid)Lems Contracting Co., Inc.DXI Construction, Inc.\$877,000.00	BIDDERS\$ AMOUNT or (Non-Responsive/No Bid)Lems Contracting Co., Inc.DXI Construction, Inc.\$877,000.00	BIDDERS\$ AMOUNT or (Non-Responsive/No Bid)Lems Contracting Co., Inc.DXI Construction, Inc.\$877,000.00	BID TABULATION	1	CONTRACT AWARDED TO:
Fawn View Construction, Inc. \$881,910.00   Lems Contracting Co., Inc. \$507,177.00	Fawn View Construction, Inc. \$881,910.00   Lems Contracting Co., Inc. \$507,177.00	Fawn View Construction, Inc. \$881,910.00   Lems Contracting Co., Inc. \$507,177.00	Fawn View Construction, Inc. \$881,910.00   Lems Contracting Co., Inc. \$507,177.00	BIDDERS		
Lems Contracting Co., Inc. \$507,177.00 VALUE OF CONTRACT:	Lems Contracting Co., Inc. \$507,177.00 VALUE OF CONTRACT:	Lems Contracting Co., Inc. \$507,177.00 VALUE OF CONTRACT:	Lems Contracting Co., Inc. \$507,177.00 VALUE OF CONTRACT:	DXI Construction, Inc.	\$877,000.00	
VALUE OF CONTRACT:	VALUE OF CONTRACT:	VALUE OF CONTRACT:	VALUE OF CONTRACT:	Fawn View Construction, Inc.	\$881,910.00	
Manual L During & Encode L (1997)				Lems Contracting Co., Inc.	\$507,177.00	VALUE OF CONTRACT
				Monumental Paving & Excavating, Inc.	\$750,000.00	

Contract Terms: One-Time Purchase

Contract Start Date: Project shall start on or around July 25, 2025 and must be completed by November 30, 2025. Note: The patio must be complete prior to the start of school.

IETHOD OF AWARD: Individual Items	Group	🔀 Total Bid	Bid
	7/23/2 Date	5	